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COMMENT LETTER NO. 7
CITIZENS FOR A BETTER ENVIRONMENT

Scott Kuhn
April 22, 2002

Response 7-1

The general comments raised in this comment have been responded to in more specific comments
that follow.  The air quality impacts associated with the proposed project have been
comprehensively evaluated in the SEIR, including the existing air quality, the impacts associated
with the proposed project and the cumulative impacts associated with a number of projects in the
area (see Final SEIR, Chapter 3 – Existing Environmental Setting, Section A – Air Quality;
Chapter 4 – Environmental Impacts and Mitigation Measures, Section A – Air Quality; and
Chapter 5 – Cumulative Impacts, Section A – Air Quality).  The proposed project is expected to
result in air quality benefits associated with a decrease in emissions (both criteria and toxic air
contaminants) from mobile sources that use the fuels.  Therefore, the use of the CARB Phase 3
fuels is expected to provide air quality benefits to all portions of southern California, including the
proposed project area.

The SCAQMD disagrees with the commentator’s opinion that the SEIR contains an inadequate
study of cumulative impacts, (see Responses 7-7, 7-67), environmental justice (see Response 7-
105) and alternatives (see Responses 7-96 through 7-98).

All feasible mitigation measures have been included in the SEIR (see Responses 7-7, 7-56, 7-61,
and 7-63).

The SCAQMD strongly disagrees with the commentator's opinion that the Draft SEIR is
inadequate and should be “re-done and re-circulated.” Based on comments received on the Draft
SEIR, minor revisions have been made in the Final SEIR.  As discussed in the following Responses
(Responses 7-2 through 7-107), those revisions did not constitute significant new information,
result in impacts substantially greater than those that were evaluated in the Draft SEIR, or
constitute significant new information that would trigger recirculation of the Draft SEIR pursuant
to CEQA Guidelines §15088.5.  Therefore, the Draft SEIR does not need to be revised and re-
circulated for public review as demonstrated by the following responses.

Response 7-2

The intent of this comment is not clear and the definition of a “Good Neighbor Agreement”
agreement is not provided in this comment.  All feasible mitigation measures have been imposed
on the proposed project (see Response 7-7).  A “Good Neighbor Agreement” is beyond the scope
of the proposed project.  SCAQMD recommends that CBE contact the refinery directly to discuss
issues outside the scope of the currently proposed project.



56

Response 7-3

Most of the modifications to the storage tank farms are associated with the CARB Phase 3
proposed project.  Because of the physical/chemical properties of ethanol, complying with CARB
Phase 3 reformulated gasoline specifications requires that the blending of gasoline be accomplished
in a different manner.  It also requires different blending components increasing the need for
storage tanks because different blending components must be stored separately until final gasoline
blending.  The California Energy Commission (CEC) has indicated that the storage tank capacity
within the state, and particularly within southern California, is constrained in the Los Angeles basin
and will be more constrained in the future (CEC, MTBE Phase Out in California, Final Report
dated March 2002).  Tankage for clean products will be reduced by 10 to 15 percent over the next
seven years by the need to comply with a new regulation from the SCAQMD (Rule 1178) requiring
tank modifications to obtain further emissions reductions.  Further, permitting, port policies and
pressure from special interest groups make it unlikely that additional terminal capacity can be
constructed.  In fact, port policies may lead to further terminal closures in the near future, resulting
in additional constraints on storage tanks (CEC, 2002).

As indicated on page 4-13 of the Final SEIR, “Two naphtha tanks at the Olympic Tank Farm (299-
TK-1002 and 299-TK-501) are being constructed to replace tanks that were lost due to the
reduction in size of the Marine Terminal and are not directly related to the CARB Phase 3 project.”
Nonetheless, the impacts associated with these two naphtha tanks were evaluated in this SEIR so
that this project and other related modifications were not “piecemealed” and their impacts
evaluated separately.  The approach taken in the Draft SEIR is required by CEQA so that impacts
from different projects occurring within similar time periods would not be underestimated.

The Final SEIR explains how each of the components of the project are required by the CARB
Phase 3 requirements in Table 2-4, page 2-12.

The comment that the project’s goal is to increase gasoline capacity is not correct.  As noted above,
the project is to comply with the CARB Phase 3 reformulated fuels specifications.  As indicated in
the Draft SEIR, the proposed project will not result in an increase in crude throughput capacity (see
Final SEIR, page 2-9).  Replacing MTBE with ethanol reduces the volume of gasoline up to about
10 percent.  By altering the mix of blending components, Ultramar can make up some of the loss in
gasoline volume. The Draft SEIR made conservative assumptions to make sure that the impacts
associated with all portions of the project were adequately evaluated and only assumed the increase
in gasoline blending components and not the decreased volume associated with the removal of
MTBE.  Therefore, the statement cited from page 1-7 of the Draft SEIR has been clarified in the
Final SEIR to indicate that increasing gasoline production is to make up for the loss of volume by
switching from MTBE to ethanol.  Further, the Final SEIR has been revised to remove the
assumption that there will be an increase in gasoline production.

Response 7-4

With regard to identifying sensitive receptors, please refer to the detailed information in Response
7-5.  The commentator inaccurately characterizes CEQA requirements by stating, “The SEIR must
analyze the existing distribution of pollution in the area to determine if there are any
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disproportionate impacts from environmental hazards or pollution on people of color and low
income people.”  Although CEQA Guidelines §15125 requires describing the existing physical
environmental conditions in the vicinity of the project, as they exist at the time the notice of
preparation is published, or if no notice of preparation is published, at the time the environmental
analysis commences, CEQA does not require an analysis of impacts on the existing setting.  Instead
the existing environmental setting “will normally constitute the baseline physical conditions by
which a lead agency determines whether an impact is significant.”  (CEQA Guidelines §15125(a)).
The SEIR identifies the existing physical environmental setting in Chapter 3.  Potential adverse
impacts from the proposed project are then calculated using the existing physical environmental
settings described in Chapter 3 as the baseline.

If the commentator’s reference to analyzing “any disproportionate impacts . . . on people of color
and low income people” refers to impacts from the proposed project, then he is incorrectly
interpreting the CEQA requirements.  Specific guidelines for analyzing adverse environmental
impacts in the SEIR are contained in CEQA Guidelines §15126.2, which states in part, “An EIR
shall identify and focus on the significant effects of the proposed project.”  There is no
requirements at this time to focus the analysis in an EIR on any specific group.  The SCAQMD is
aware of the efforts at the state level to develop guidelines for analyzing environmental justice
impacts and will monitor this process.

As explained in detail in Responses 7-5 and 7-6, the SEIR has complied with all relevant CEQA
requirements for analyzing potential adverse impacts from the proposed project.

Response 7-5

This comment is incorrect regarding the impacts on sensitive populations.  Volume 2 of the SEIR
includes an extensive review of the potential impacts of the proposed project at each of the
proposed project sites on the surrounding community, including sensitive receptors.  The identified
sensitive receptors include schools, parks, hospitals, and daycare facilities.  The reference in the
comment to a “six mile impact zone” is unclear and not based on data regarding the project
impacts.  The sensitive populations within the one per million cancer risk isopleth were identified.
A number of sensitive populations were identified, however, because the project sites are located
within heavy industrial areas, a large number of sensitive receptors were not identified.  Finally, the
potential impacts associated with exposure to the closest sensitive populations were identified.  In
all cases, the potential impacts to the closest sensitive populations and the closest residential
populations to each of the project sites were identified and determined to be less than significant.
Therefore, an analysis of potential adverse impacts to other sensitive populations further away from
the refinery, marine terminal or tank farms is not necessary since the impacts associated with the
proposed project at areas further from the project sites would be less than identified in the SEIR
and, therefore, also less than significant.  Although the commentator identifies a general list of
sensitive receptors, he does not identify any specific sensitive populations that were not included in
the analysis.

The hazards associated with a release, accidents and fires for the proposed project (including the
Refinery, Marine Terminal, Marine Tank Farm, and Olympic Tank Farm) have been evaluated
extensively in Volume III of the Final SEIR.  In all cases, the hazards identified for the proposed
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project would be reduced or the impacts would only extend into the immediate vicinity of the
project site, which are all industrial areas.  No hazards were identified that would extend into
residential areas or impact other sensitive populations (page 4-70, Volume I of the Final SEIR and
Volume III of the Final SEIR).

The impacts associated with the construction phase have been fully evaluated in the Final SEIR
(see Final SEIR Chapter 4, Section A, and Appendix A).  The impacts of the proposed construction
phase have been considered to be significant and mitigation measures have been imposed.  The
construction emissions will cease following completion of construction activities and do not
impose long-term emission impacts.

Finally, the impacts associated with the operational phase of the proposed project have been fully
evaluated in the Final SEIR (see Final SEIR Chapter 4, Section A, and Appendix A).  The impacts
of the operation of the proposed project have been considered to be significant and mitigation
measures have been imposed, where feasible.  Further, the proposed project is expected to result in
an emission benefit associated with mobile sources that utilize the reformulated fuels resulting in
emission reductions.  A reduction in toxic air contaminant emissions is also expected for vehicles
that use the reformulated fuels.  Therefore, the proposed project is expected to result in emission
benefits as well.

There is no question that poor air quality can exacerbate respiratory problems such as asthma.  The
SEIR discloses that the proposed project is expected to generate significant adverse regional air
quality impacts, which could affect sensitive populations, especially those with respiratory
problems.  No localized air quality impacts, however, were identified for the proposed project.  As
a result, the SEIR fulfills the letter and intent of CEQA, i.e., to disclose information on potential
adverse impacts to the public.

Response 7-6

See Response 7-5 above regarding the potential hazard impacts of accidental releases and potential
air quality impacts from the proposed project.  The opinion in this comment that a CEQA
document must identify low-income health care providers is incorrect.  The availability of health
care facilities is not required to be evaluated in the environmental setting of a CEQA document.

The Final EIR concluded that no significant impacts were expected due to exposure to toxic air
contaminants or hazards from the Refinery, marine terminal and tank farms, and has disclosed the
estimated emissions and risk related to the proposed project.  Because no significant health impacts
are expected, the proposed project is not expected to result in a need for new or impact existing
health care providers.  Therefore, it is not necessary to include information regarding health care
providers in this SEIR.  This information is included in the City’s general plan, which should be
consulted for further information.

An EIR only needs to include information relevant to the proposed project.  The adequacy of an
EIR is determined in terms of what is reasonably feasible, in light of factors such as the magnitude
of the project at issue, the severity of its likely environmental impacts, and the geographic scope of
the project (CEQA Guidelines 15204).  “CEQA does not require a lead agency to conduct every
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test or perform all research, study, and experimentation recommended or demanded by
commentators.  When responding to comments, lead agencies need only to respond to significant
environmental issues and do not need to provide all information requested by reviewers, as long as
a good faith effort at full disclosure is made in the EIR.” (CEQA Guidelines 15204(a)).

In addition, CEQA requires that impacts that have physical consequences be evaluated.  “In
evaluating the significance of an environmental effect of a project, the lead agency shall consider
direct physical changes in the environment which may be caused by the project and reasonably
foreseeable indirect physical changes in the environment which may be caused by the project”
(CEQA Guidelines §15064(d)).  The proposed project impacts on the health effects associated with
exposure to toxic air contaminants were evaluated and concluded to be less than significant.
Therefore, no physical impacts related to health care providers are expected.  Social issues only
need to be addressed in an EIR when there is the potential for physical changes (CEQA Guidelines
§15064(f)(6)).  No such physical changes resulting from social issues were identified for the
proposed project.

Response 7-7

With regard to the incorrect assertion that the SEIR must analyze disproportionate environmental
impacts of the existing environment, the commentator is referred to Response 7-4.  Relative to the
CEQA requirement to discuss any inconsistencies between the proposed project and applicable
general plans and regional plans, the Draft and Final SEIR included discussions of these plans, as
applicable.  See the Final SEIR pages 3-18 and 4-17 regarding the Air Quality Management Plan.
See Final EIR page 3-25 regarding the Los Angeles General Plan Seismic Safety Element.  See
Final EIR page 3-32 regarding the Port of Los Angeles Mater Plan.  See Final EIR pages 3-39
through 3-40 regarding wastewater discharge requirements.  See Final SEIR page 3-42 through 3-
43 regarding the Los Angeles General Plan.  See Final EIR page 3-42 regarding the Wilmington-
Harbor City Specific Plan.  See Final EIR pages 3-58 through 3-59 regarding traffic management
plans in the Wilmington area.  See Final SEIR, Chapter 3, Section A for the air quality
environmental setting.  See Final SEIR, Chapter 5, Section A for the cumulative air quality impacts
and mitigation measures and Response 6-5.  The project-related emissions have been mitigated to
the extent feasible.  Further, the cumulative emissions will be mitigated on a project-by project
basis.  For more detailed information relative to the existing setting for the proposed project, refer
to Responses 7-4 and 7-8.  For a more detailed response to the comment regarding potential
inconsistencies between the proposed project and relevant local plans, refer to Response 7-9.

Response 7-8

The Final SEIR has addressed existing regional air quality and potential adverse impacts associated
with the potential exposure to all populations (regardless of race or economic status) and has
addressed the impacts of the proposed project to all populations near the Refinery including
sensitive populations, residents and workers near the Refinery.

The Final SEIR includes a discussion of the existing cancer risk in the South Coast Air Basin (see
Final SEIR, page 3-8).  The SEIR indicates that the average cancer risk in the Basin is about 1,400
per million due to exposure to various toxic air contaminants. These data are based on air
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monitoring and testing completed as part of the SCAQMD’s Multiple Air Toxic Exposure Study,
referred to as MATES-II.

The regional distribution of air quality was provided in the SEIR (see Final EIR pages 3-2 through
3-5).  Coastal areas of the South Coast Air Basin tend to have better air quality than the inland
areas of the Basin.  For example, the ozone standards are exceed frequently in the San Gabriel
Valley, Riverside, Coachella Valley and San Bernardino Valley.  The ozone standards are only
exceeded a few days each year in the coastal areas (e.g., South Coastal Los Angeles County
Monitoring Station).

The comments related to the TSDF facilities in Los Angeles County are unrelated to the proposed
project and no response is required.  With regard to analyzing disproportionate impacts on specific
populations, refer to Response 7-4.  Finally, the SCAQMD has complied with all relevant CEQA
requirements in its analysis of the proposed project.

Response 7-9

The Draft and Final SEIR addressed the regional plans that are applicable to the proposed project.
For example, compliance with the air quality management plans is addressed on page 4-17 of the
Final SEIR.  The proposed project is not expected to result in an increase in wastewater (see Final
SEIR pages 4-78 through 4-79) or solid/hazardous waste generated (see Final SEIR pages 4-89
through 4-91) during the operational phase of the project.  The project is expected to result in an
increase of eight workers which are expected to come from the existing labor pool in southern
California so that no impacts on housing are expected.  Finally, the proposed project is located
within existing industrial facilities.  The natural habitat has been removed from these facilities and
no impacts on any natural communities or conservation plans are not expected.

Response 7-10

The data from the MATES-II Study are provided in the environmental setting portion of the SEIR
(see page 3-8).  The comments regarding the results in the MATES II study are incorrect (see
MATES II Study, Figure 3-3).

The commentator mistakenly infers from the Kings County Farm Bureau v. City of Hanford case
(221 Cal. App. 3d 692, 717-18 (1990)) that, "Given the existing cancer risks for the nearby
community, any increase in toxic pollution must be considered significant and must be mitigated
fully."  The court did not make such a finding in this case.  The lead agency for this project under
consideration in this case concluded that because ozone levels were "already bad," the incremental
addition from the project must be treated as minor.  As the court explained, "[t]he EIR's analysis
uses the magnitude of the current ozone problem in the air basin in order to trivialize the projects
impact."  The court's conclusion is very different than the commentator's assertion that any
pollution increase should be considered significant.  In any event, the SCAQMD's conclusion that
air toxic impacts are not significant is based on quantifying the health risks (cancer and non-cancer
health risks) using established and approved methodologies and comparing the results to an
adopted significance threshold, which is consistent with CEQA Guidelines  §15064(h)(3).
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The toxic air contaminant emissions from the proposed project are less than the significance criteria
and less than significant (also see Response 7-8).  Therefore, mitigation measures for toxic air
contaminants are not required under CEQA.  Mitigation measures need only to be imposed when a
significant impact related to the proposed project has been identified (CEQA §15126.4(a)(1)(A)
and §15126.4(a)(3)).

The proposed project is required to comply with the applicable portions of SCAQMD New Source
Review rules (SCAQMD Regulation XIII) and toxic air contaminant rules, e.g., SCAQMD Rule
1401.  However, compliance with all applicable SCAQMD rules and regulations is required as part
of the proposed project (i.e., part of the project description) and is not considered to be mitigation.
The important point is to note that the proposed project is required to comply with all applicable
SCAQMD rules and regulations, including use of Best Available Control Technology pursuant to
Rule 1303(a) (which requires the use of bellow sealed valves) and inspection and maintenance
programs (SCAQMD Rule 1173).

Emissions from the marine terminal are included in the Final SEIR Table 4-7 (stationary source
emission changes), Table 4-8 (emissions associated with additional marine vessels), Table 4-14
(cancer risk for the marine terminal), Table 4-15 (cancer risk associated with marine vessels),
Appendix A (emission calculations), and the Health Risk Assessment – Volume II of the Final
SEIR (details of the health risk calculations for the marine terminal).  Please refer to Response 6-3
regarding the SCAQMD's authority to impose mitigation measures on marine vessels.

Response 7-11

Please note that the refinery is an existing operating refinery and will not be “resuming” operations
as part of the proposed project.  The impacts associated with the proposed project including marine
terminal emissions and truck transportation emissions have been included in the Final SEIR.

The emissions from diesel engines were included in the Final SEIR, Tables 4-6 and 4-7 and
Appendix A.

The proposed project will lead to increased emissions of diesel exhaust particulate matter from
onsite construction equipment and diesel-fueled truck exhaust and from off-site diesel truck
exhaust during construction. An Advisory Committee was formed to advise the CARB staff in its
preparation of an assessment of the need to further control toxic air pollutants from diesel-fueled
engines. The Risk Management Subcommittee was formed to identify the:  (1) operating
parameters; (2) emission factors; and (3) modeling methodologies recommended for estimating
human health risks from diesel-fueled engines.  This information will be used by the Subcommittee
to develop the scenarios to evaluate the risks associated with exposure to diesel particulate
emissions.  The SCAQMD is waiting for this guidance before initiating a quantitative risk analysis
for diesel particulate emissions.

Significant impacts associated with exposure to diesel particulate emissions are not expected during
construction activities. As listed in Table 4-4 of the Final SEIR, the highest construction related on-
site and off-site diesel exhaust particulate matter emissions is estimated to be 26 pounds per day
and less than one pound per day, respectively.  These emissions are expected to cease within about
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one year. Therefore, long-term exposure to construction-related diesel exhaust particulate matter
that could result in significant cancer risks to sensitive populations is not expected.

Significant impacts associated with exposure to diesel particulate emissions are not expected during
operation of the proposed project.   Since the proposed project is not expected to result in an
increase in gasoline production, no increase in emissions from diesel engines are expected due to
the transportation of gasoline.  The Final SEIR has been revised to reflect this change.

Total truck exhaust PM10 emissions associated with trucks used to transport ethanol (and evaluated
in the Previous Final EIR) are estimated to be 3 pounds per day (see Final SEIR Table 4-6). The
maximum emissions at any single location will occur in the vicinity of a third-party terminal,
because all of the trucks will leave that location.  The emission rate for one truck at a speed of 25
mph is about 0.6 grams per mile.  Therefore, the total emissions from 30 trucks per day (60 truck
trips) travelling over the one-quarter mile into and out of a terminal (assuming all trucks would be
traveling to/from the same terminal) would be about 9 grams per day or about 0.02 pound per day.
Therefore, significant cancer risks associated with exposure to diesel particulate emissions are not
expected.  It should be noted that these trucks are expected to use a number of other third party
terminals and these diesel emissions would occur at several sites and not one site so that the
emissions at any one site would be even less than 0.02 pound per day.

Response 7-12

The proposed project impacts on VOC, NOx, SOx, and PM10 emissions are expected to exceed the
SCAQMD significance thresholds and are considered significant so that feasible mitigation
measures are required.  See the Final SEIR pages 4-31 through 4-56 for a discussion of feasible
mitigation measures for the proposed project.  Also see Responses 6-3, 7-56, 7-61 and 7-48.

Also, note that long-term air quality benefits are expected to occur due to the implementation of the
CARB Phase 3 regulations (see Final SEIR, Chapter 5).

CEQA does not include any requirements stating that there should be no net increase in any kind of
environmental impact from a project.  CEQA allows an agency to approve projects with significant
adverse environmental impacts after all feasible mitigation is imposed, provided a Statement of
Findings and Statement of Overriding Considerations is prepared.

Response 7-13

Storage tanks are cleaned on a periodic basis and not on a routine basis.  Tanks are cleaned for
example when the material stored within the tank is changed and the two materials are
incompatible or for maintenance activities.  The cleaning of storage tanks at the refinery is not part
of the proposed project, and no storage tanks are expected to be cleaned as part of the proposed
project.  Therefore, no additional emissions associated with storage tanks cleaning are expected
from the proposed project.

Because tank cleaning can result in significant air emissions, the SCAQMD has imposed
SCAQMD Rule 1149 – Storage Tank Degassing.  Rule 1149 requires that emissions from storage
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tank degassing be controlled through one of several approved methods.  Therefore, storage tank
cleaning operations in the South Coast Air Basin are required to be controlled, are not expected to
be a significant source of emissions, and are accounted for in the SCAQMD's Air Quality
Management Plan emission inventory for the South Coast Air Basin.

Response 7-14

The Draft SEIR included the emissions from pressure relief valves (PRVs) (see Appendix A) that
are included as part of the proposed project. The PRVs are subject to the SCAQMD’s BACT
requirements.  The emissions from these devices will be routed to existing air pollution control
devices (see Final SEIR, page 4-13) so that VOC emissions from PRVs are expected to be
negligible.  In addition, these devices are required to be inspected for leaks per the requirements of
SCAQMD Rule 1173.

Response 7-15

As described in the Draft EIR, the emissions from all new and modified storage tanks will be
controlled through the use of Best Available Control Technology (BACT), which consists of
internal floating roof tanks.  BACT, by definition, is control equipment with the lowest achievable
emission rate.  The use of BACT controls emissions to the greatest extent feasible for the new and
modified emission sources.  Therefore, additional VOC emission reductions (through mitigation
measures) from storage tanks associated with the proposed project are not feasible.  Further, the
proposed project includes taking old tanks (that do not currently comply with BACT) and replacing
or upgrading them with equipment that includes BACT, which should result in fewer emissions
from tank fittings and seals.  The emissions from the storage tanks have been calculated and
included in Appendix A of the SEIR.

Response 7-16

See Response 7-15 regarding the control of emissions from storage tanks by complying with Rule
1303 BACT requirements.  See Response 7-12 regarding emissions from storage tank cleaning.

Response 7-17

See Response 7-14 regarding the control of VOC emissions from pressure relief devices.

Response 7-18

As explained in the Final SEIR (see page 4-31), “all fugitive components will be required to be
included in an inspection and maintenance program, as required by SCAQMD Rule 1173, to ensure
that the equipment is properly maintained.”  Rule 1173 requires that all accessible pumps,
compressors, and pressure relief devices be audio-visually inspected once during every eight-hour
operating period.  Rule 1173 also requires that all accessible components be inspected (via testing)
on a quarterly basis.   Rule 1173 requires inspection and record keeping and various SCAQMD
rules and regulations allow for monetary penalties for non-compliance.  Measures beyond those
required by Rule 1173 are not required because the proposed project will incorporate BACT.  The
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use of BACT minimizes the potential for leaks from fugitive components.  For example, the pumps
for the proposed project will be sealless pumps and, therefore, less likely to leak.  The process
valves will be mostly leakless valves that are also not expected to leak. (It should be noted that, in
order to provide a conservative emission estimate in the SEIR, the emission calculations for the
fugitive components did not include the use of BACT.  Therefore, the overall project emissions
from fugitive components have been overestimated since BACT is required to be installed). The
requirements for inspection and maintenance are already part of the proposed project and are not
considered to be mitigation for purposes of the SEIR.

Response 7-19

The comment is incorrect.  See Response 7-3 regarding the comment that all aspects of the project
are required to comply with CARB Phase 3 requirements.  As explained in Response 7-3, several
storage tanks are being modified due to the loss in storage capacity at the Ultramar marine
terminal.  Emissions from these tanks must be offset pursuant to Rule 1303.

Capacity at a refinery is determined by the quantity of crude processed.  As described in the SEIR,
the proposed project will not result in an increase in the crude capacity refined at the Refinery, and
therefore, will not increase the capacity of the refinery.  Therefore, the offset exemption in Rule
1304 (c)(4) applies to the portions of the proposed project associated with compliance with the
CARB Phase 3 requirements.  Please note that the Final SEIR has been revised to show that there
will be no increase in gasoline produced at the Refinery and no increase in truck traffic related to
gas distribution (see Response 7-3).

Response 7-20

The project’s impacts on water resources have been addressed in the SEIR (see Chapters 3 and 4,
Section D).  It is true that the existing Refinery operations require water.  However, the proposed
project is not expected to require any additional water since there are no proposed units or
modifications to existing units that would require additional water (see Final SEIR, page 4-80).
Therefore, no significant impacts on water demand or wastewater generation were identified and no
mitigation measures are required.

Response 7-21

Ultramar uses third party terminals (i.e., terminals not owned or operated by Ultramar) to distribute
gasoline to gasoline stations.  Since ethanol must be blended at the terminals, ethanol will be
blended into gasoline produced by Ultramar at the third party terminals. Ethanol will not be
received, stored, blended or transferred at any of the Ultramar facilities so the issues related to this
comment are considered speculative. However, the following responds to the general comment
regarding the Lawrence Livermore National Laboratory report.

The release of ethanol may be potentially significant and increase the concentration of hydrophobic
compounds in ground water, however, because of the following measures are included as part of
standard operations at third party terminals that would handle ethanol, no significant ethanol
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release or impacts are expected:  (1) source control programs, cathodic protection, periodic testing
of pipelines, and so forth, are standard practice at terminals that are expected to receive, store and
transfer gasoline and ethanol; and (2) terminals have existing ground water sampling programs
which will be expanded to include ethanol.  The proposed project does not include the installation
of any new underground storage tanks or above ground storage tanks for ethanol.  However,
additional underground storage tank requirements have been imposed in California which further
reduce the potential for leaks, e.g., double containment requirements, and leak detection systems.

It is also important to note that the study completed by Lawrence Livermore National Laboratory
(LLNL) is only one of a number of reports used by the state to review the elimination of MTBE
from gasoline. Extensive analysis was completed by the University of California, California Air
Resources Board, Regional Water Quality Control Board, among others, associated with SB 521.
The LLNL report (UCRL-AR-135949, 1999) presents information on releases of ethanol to soil
and surface waters.  This document was prepared as part of Senate Bill 521 (SB 521), enacting the
MTBE Public Health and Environmental Protection Act of 1997 which directed the University of
California to conduct research on the effects of MTBE.  SB 521 also required the Governor to take
appropriate action based on the findings of the report and information from public hearings.   In
consideration of this study, public testimony, and other relevant information, California’s Governor
Davis found that, “on balance, there is significant risk to the environment from using MTBE in
gasoline in California.”  In response to this finding, on March 25, 1999, the Governor issued
Executive Order D-5-99 which directed, among other things, that California phase-out the use of
MTBE in gasoline.  The LLNL report also indicates that eliminating the use of MTBE and
replacing it with ethanol is expected to mitigate the ground water problems created by MTBE.
Therefore, on balance, the decision to eliminate MTBE is expected to provide beneficial impacts to
ground water quality throughout the state.

Response 7-22

The proposed project will occur at existing facilities so a terrorist attack and resulting effects would
in large be part of the existing setting.  Further in response to the September 11, 2001 terrorist
attacks in New York, increased/enhanced safety/security measures are being put into place or are
already in place (see Responses 4-2 and 7-25).

The hazards related to the proposed project have been addressed in the SEIR, Volume 1, Chapter 4,
Section C and Volume III.  The fire hazards (or other related hazards) associated with the proposed
project would be the same, regardless of whether the event that triggered the release or fire was
caused by an intentional act, an accidental event, or a natural event.  The proposed project hazard
impacts have been addressed in the SEIR.  Measures that would minimize the hazards, which are
outlined in the Final SEIR (see pages 4-73 and 4-74) also minimize the impacts of a terrorist attack.
All Ultramar facilities are fenced and access to the sites is limited.  Further, access to the sites is
provided through guarded gates only.

Response 7-23

The comment is incorrect.  The proposed project would not build any new storage tanks closer to
residential areas than currently exist. Further, the proposed project includes taking old tanks (that
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do not currently comply with BACT) and replacing or upgrading them with equipment that has
BACT, which should result in fewer emissions from tank fittings and seals.  See Response 7-22
regarding the hazard impacts associated with terrorist acts.  Further, no hazard impacts were
identified that would impact any residential areas because residential areas are located a sufficient
distance from the proposed project sites to avoid hazard impacts.

Response 7-24

See Response 7-22 regard hazard impacts associated with terrorist acts.  The December 2001 Final
EIR discussed the potential impacts related to tanker trucks.  The following is the evaluation of the
transportation of hazardous materials in the December 2001 Final EIR.  Transportation hazards
were evaluated in the December 2001 Final EIR to evaluate the transport of ethanol, high octane
blending components and propane/propylene associated with the CARB Phase 3 project.  A
summary of the transportation hazards will be included in the Final SEIR.

The transportation of hazardous materials also can result in offsite releases through accidents or
equipment failure.  The proposed project will increase the amount of hazardous materials
transported to the Refinery.

Ethanol/MTBE

The proposed project would eliminate the use of MTBE and would eliminate the transport
of MTBE to the Marine Terminal and Refinery via marine vessel.  Ethanol, instead of
MTBE, would be transported into the area via railcars.  The use of ethanol is expected to
provide an environmental benefit over the use of MTBE.  In the event of a leak or spill,
while ethanol is more soluble than MTBE, ethanol is expected to present less of a risk of
ground water contamination since it breaks down in the environment more rapidly than
MTBE.  Also, the health impacts related to ethanol exposure are limited (CARB, 1999).

The proposed project will increase the truck transport of ethanol by about 30 trucks per day.
The distance traveled by all ethanol trucks per day was estimated to be about 960 miles per
day.  The estimated accidental release rate for all ethanol truck delivery is about 0.1
accident per year or about one accident in 10 years.  Ethanol is not an acutely hazardous
material and the hazards related to the transport of ethanol are expected to be less than those
associated with the transport of MTBE and less than significant, as discussed below.

The overall hazards associated with the handling and transport of ethanol are expected to be
less than those associated with MTBE.  Ethanol has a lower vapor pressure than MTBE (49-
56.5 mmHg for ethanol as compared to 245-256 mmHg for MTBE) (API, 2000).
Therefore, a release of ethanol would travel a smaller distance than a release of MTBE,
given the same conditions.  In addition, the toxicity of ethanol is less than the toxicity of
MTBE as shown in Table 1.  Therefore, the health impacts in the event of a release of
ethanol also are expected to be less than the health impacts associated with an MTBE
release.
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The proposed project is expected to require the delivery of ethanol via railcars.  A
maximum of about nine railcars per day may be required to deliver ethanol.  These railcars
are expected to arrive on one train per day.  The proposed project is not expected to change
the probability of a train accident, derailment, or potential release of material in the event of
an accident.  Rail accidents are generally weather or mechanical-related.  The proposed
project will not change the average number of railcars that would derail and/or rupture in
the event of an accident.   Further, in the event of an ethanol release, the health effects are
expected to be less than significant. The overall hazards associated with the handling and
transport of ethanol are expected to be less than those associated with MTBE. Therefore, a
release of ethanol would travel a smaller distance, persist in the environment for less time,
and result in fewer health impacts than a release of MTBE, given the same conditions.  The
hazards related to the transport of ethanol instead of MTBE are expected to be less than
significant.

TABLE 1

HEALTH ASSESSMENT VALUES AND HEALTH PROTECTIVE CONCENTRATIONS

Non-Cancer Cancer
1-Hour
(ug/m3)

Annual Average
(ug/m3)

Unit Risk Factor
(ug/m3)-1

Ethanol 100,000
(53,000 ppb)

100,000
(53,000 ppb)

No evidence of
carcinogencity by

inhalation.
MTBE 25,000

(7,000 ppb)
3000

(800 ppb)
2.6 x 10-7

(9.3 x 10-7 ppb-1)
Source:  OEHHA, 2000.

The Refinery has spill containment systems in place to reduce the impacts of spills of
petroleum products.  The marine terminals generally use a water collection and treatment
system to prevent discharges of petroleum products to the port.  Drip pans and funnels drain
to collection areas to contain leaks.  Ship washings and ballast water are stored in two tanks
for further treatment and disposal.  Spills that would reach the water are controlled by
deploying the oil booms.  Additional spill equipment is available through commercial
contracts with suppliers that specialize in spill cleanup.  Commercial contractors that
specialize in oil cleanup are employed to place any additional booms or equipment, and to
remove oil from the water and adjacent areas.

The Ultramar Refinery has a Spill Prevention Containment and Countermeasures (SPCC)
Plan per the requirements of 40 CFR, Section 112.  The SPCC is designed to prevent spills
from on-site facilities and includes requirements for secondary containment, emergency
response procedures, training requirements, and so forth.



68

High Octane Blending Components

The proposed project is expected to result in the delivery of additional high octane blending
components (e.g., alkylate and isooctane) to a marine terminal and elimination of MTBE
deliveries via marine vessel.

The proposed project would increase the delivery of high octane blending components,
including alkylate and isooctane. Alkylate and isooctane are currently shipped and stored at
local marine terminals so the proposed project will increase the amount of high octane
blending components shipped to the ports.  These materials are currently transported into
the port area so that the project is not expected to result in new hazards to the port area.
Therefore, no new hazards or increased risk will be introduced to the Port area.

Response 7-25

The impacts related to hazards at the marine terminal are existing hazards and were included in the
Final SEIR (see page 3-32). The proposed project will result in a net increase of about 65 marine
vessels per year for the transport of gasoline blending products.  The proposed project will handle
materials currently shipped into the port areas and will not introduce new hazards to the area so,
even though the number of vessels will increase, no significant impacts are expected.  In addition,
the California State Lands Commission has adopted the Marine Oil Terminal Physical Security
Program (2 CCR §2351) on March 7, 2002 in response to recent terrorist attacks.  The regulations
require that each terminal prepares a Marine Oil Terminal Security Plan (MOTSP) and submits it to
the California State Lands Commission (CSLC) for review and approval.  The MOTSPs are
designed to:  (1) provide for the safety and security of persons, property and equipment on the
terminal and along the dockside of vessels moored at the terminal; (2) prevent and deter the
carrying of any weapon, incendiary, or explosive on or about any person inside the terminal,
including within his or her personal articles; (3) prevent and deter the introduction of any weapon,
incendiary, or explosive in stores or carried by persons onto the terminal or to the dockside of
vessels moored at the terminal; and (4) prevent or deter unauthorized access to the terminal and to
the dockside of vessels moored at the terminal (2 CCR §2351(b)(1-4)).  Ultramar has prepared a
MOTSP, which is currently under review by the CSLC.  The above information has been
incorporated into the Final SEIR (see page 3-32).

Response 7-26

The comment related to the increased use of the alkylation unit and increased use of hydrofluoric
acid (HF) is incorrect.  The proposed project does not include modifications to the Alkylation unit
or any other unit associated with the use or storage of HF (see Chapter 2 – Project Description).
The alkylation unit currently operates at full capacity so that the only way to increase the
production through the alkylation unit is to modify the unit and increase the capacity.  No such
changes are proposed as part of the proposed project and no increase in HF use is proposed or
expected at the Refinery.  The proposed project will not result in a change in the use, amount
transported, amount stored or hazards related to the use of HF.  The use of HF and modifications to
the use of HF is outside the scope of the proposed project.
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Response 7-27

The impacts of the proposed project of land use are discussed in Chapter 4, Section E – Land
Use/Planning.  Specific comments related to the potential land use and planning impacts are
addressed in Responses 7-28 through 7-38 below.

Response 7-28

The proposed project sites are located within the jurisdiction of the City and Port of Los Angeles.
The land use in these areas are controlled by the City of Los Angeles General Plan and the Port of
Los Angeles Master Plan, respectively.  The Los Angeles County General Plan applies to
unincorporated county land and not land within incorporated cities.  Therefore, the Los Angeles
County General Plan does not apply to the proposed project sites; however, if it did, it would not be
inconsistent with the proposed project. As discussed in the SEIR (Chapter 4, Section E – Land
Use), the proposed project will be constructed within the confines of existing industrial facilities.
All facilities are zoned for heavy industrial uses, which allows for the continued storage of
petroleum products or refining activities.  The areas surrounding the proposed project sites are also
industrial.  Heavy industrial uses would be the only use compatible with the surrounding areas.
Other uses, e.g., commercial or residential uses would conflict with the industrial uses and be
incompatible with the current industrial uses.

The proposed project would not impact the General Plan element quoted in this comment.  The
proposed project would not discriminate in housing (no new housing is proposed as part of the
project), jobs/income (the proposed project is only expected to create a few jobs), education
(impacts on education facilities are not part of the proposed project), recreation (the proposed
project would not impact recreational facilities), or other facets of living (no social impacts have
been identified associated with the proposed project).

Response 7-29

A hazards analysis has been completed for the proposed project.  The analysis indicates that the
proposed project could have hazards that extend just outside of the proposed project sites but those
hazards would remain in industrial areas.  No impacts outside of industrial areas were identified.
All feasible mitigation measures have been imposed including the preparation of a Process Safety
Management Program, and  Risk Management Program for the applicable portions of the proposed
project (See Final SEIR pages 4-73 and 4-74 for further details).  Therefore, the proposed project is
expected to be consistent with the Los Angeles County General Plan, even though the proposed
project sites are not under the jurisdiction of the Los Angeles County General Plan.

Response 7-30

As discussed in the Final SEIR (see pages 4-75 through 4-80), the proposed project is not expected
to result in an increase in water use, after the construction phase so no impacts on water demand are
expected.  Consequently, the proposed project would not be inconsistent with the General Goals
and Policies cited by the commentator.  Further, the implementation of the proposed project will
eliminate MTBE from the gasoline supply.  MTBE has contaminated drinking water supplies in
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some areas.  Therefore, implementation of the proposed project will comply with the CARB
mandated regulations to eliminate MTBE and protect drinking water supplies.

Response 7-31

The proposed project will be constructed within the confines of existing industrial sites and would
not cause construction or paving within ground water recharge and watershed areas so no impact
on ground water recharge is expected.  Based on this conclusion, the proposed project would not be
inconsistent with the Public Facilities policies identified by the commentator.  The proposed project
is not expected to result in an increase in water use, after the construction phase of the proposed
project, so no increase in water use or need for water conservation or use of reclaimed water is
required.  The implementation of the proposed project will eliminate MTBE from the gasoline
supply.  MTBE has contaminated drinking water supplies in some areas.  Therefore,
implementation of the proposed project will comply with the CARB mandated regulations to
eliminate MTBE and protect drinking water supplies.

Response 7-32

See Response 7-31 regarding the projection of ground water.

Response 7-33

The proposed project requires the installation of Best Available Control Technology so that
emissions associated with the proposed project have been controlled to the maximum extent
feasible.  Further, the proposed project is expected to result in air quality benefits by producing
cleaner-burning fuels, so that vehicles that use the fuels will produce less air emissions, providing a
regional air quality benefit.  Consequently, the proposed project would not be inconsistent with the
policy goal identified in this comment.

Response 7-34

See Response 7-33 with regard to air quality impacts.  The proposed project is being implemented
to comply with CARB Phase 3 fuel specifications which have been developed to further minimize
air emissions from vehicles that use fuel.  Consequently, the proposed project would not be
inconsistent with the policy goal identified in this comment.

Response 7-35

The proposed project is not expected to require additional energy (natural gas or electricity) so that
no impacts on energy resources are expected.  Consequently, the proposed project would not be
inconsistent with the policy goal identified in this comment.

Response 7-36

Based on the hazards analysis prepared for the project, no significant adverse hazard impacts have
been identified associated with the movement of materials proposed as part of the project (e.g.,
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ethanol and other gasoline blending components). Therefore, the proposed project is expected to be
consistent with the Los Angeles County General Plan regarding circulation, even though the
proposed project sites are not under the jurisdiction of the Los Angeles County General Plan.

Response 7-37

The proposed project is expected to require about eight additional workers during the operational
phase of the proposed project, four at the Marine Tank Farm and four at the Olympic Tank Farm.
These workers are expected to be part of the existing labor pool of southern California.  No
significant adverse impacts on traffic were identified associated with the increase in workers so
there is no requirement for carpooling or other activities.  Ultramar has an existing transportation
management plan and the new workers would be required to participate in the transportation
management plan, which includes incentives to carpool. Therefore, the proposed project is
expected to be consistent with the Los Angeles County General Plan regarding conservation, open
space and recreation, even though the proposed project sites are not under the jurisdiction of the
Los Angeles County General Plan.

Response 7-38

The proposed project would not adversely affect housing or opportunities for housing.  The
conclusions of the SEIR regarding land use/planning remain unchanged, i.e., that the proposed
project is consistent with the existing land use and zoning requirements so that no significant
impacts of land use/planning are expected. Therefore, the proposed project is expected to be
consistent with the Los Angeles County General Plan Housing Element, even though the proposed
project sites are not under the jurisdiction of the Los Angeles County General Plan.  See Response
7-28 regarding housing impacts.

Response 7-39

The comment is incorrect.  The Wilmington Avenue/223rd Street intersection is located within the
City of Carson, not the City of Los Angeles.  The intersection of Wilmington Avenue/223rd Street
currently operates at LOS E during the morning and LOS F during the evening (see Final SEIR
Table 4-24, page 4-94). This intersection is located about two miles northwest of the Ultramar
Refinery and is impacted by traffic from other refineries and industrial facilities located closer to
the intersection.  Traffic from the proposed project is not expected to adversely affect the
Wilmington Avenue/223rd Street intersection, i.e., the project will not contribute to traffic at this
intersection.  Free-flowing traffic would continue at all intersections except the intersection of
Wilmington Aveue/223rd Street, which is already at LOS E and F.  The Ultramar proposed project
would not contribute traffic to this intersection.  Therefore, the proposed project impacts on traffic
during the operational phase are considered less than significant.

Response 7-40

Section 15064(f) of the CEQA Guidelines indicates the following:  “Evidence of economic and
social impacts that do not contribute to or are not caused by physical changes in the environment is
not substantial evidence that the project may have a significant effect on the environment.”
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Further, CEQA Guidelines Section 15131(a) indicates that economic or social effects of a project
shall not be treated as significant effects on the environment and that the analysis shall focus on
physical changes.  Also see Response 7-41 through 7-43.

The commentator incorrectly mistakenly refers to Citizens Association for Sensible Development
of Bishop Area v. County of Inyo.  In this case, the court invalidated a negative declaration for a
new suburban shopping center because the project would compete with existing downtown stores,
thus possibly contributing to a physical deterioration of the downtown area.  The case is not
relevant to the proposed Ultramar project since no new commercial/industrial facility is being built
that could compete with an existing facility.  The same conclusion is reached regarding Citizens for
Quality Growth v. City of Mt. Shasta where a parcel was rezoned for commercial and
manufacturing uses.  The Mt. Shasta case is not applicable to the proposed project since no change
in zoning or land use is proposed as part of the Ultramar project.  Also, since the affected project
sites are in industrially zoned areas, and not urban areas, it is not likely that they will contribute to
urban blight.  There needs to be a clear cause and effect of blight.  The proposed project will help
reduce existing blight by upgrading, painting and replacing existing tanks that, in some cases have
deteriorated as a result of non-use by the previous owner.

Response 7-41

The CEQA guidelines indicate that economic or social information may be included in an EIR or
may be presented in whatever form the agency desires (CEQA Guidelines 15131).  The guidelines
further state that the “Economic and social changes resulting from a project shall not be treated as
significant effects on the environment” unless there is some physical change (CEQA Guidelines
15064(f)).  The proposed project is not expected to increase the permanent work force at the
Refinery, impact housing or population.  Therefore, no physical impacts are expected from the
proposed project.  The Refinery has been located at the site since 1970 and during that time the area
has seen significant urban growth including an increase in property values, increased residents in
the area, increased commercial/industrial development, more schools, and so forth.  Therefore,
there is no evidence that the modifications to existing industrial facilities as proposed with this
project would result in a urban deterioration in the Wilmington or other surrounding areas.

The proposed project would modify several existing storage tank farms, an existing marine
terminal, and an existing Refinery which are all located within industrial areas.  New facilities
would not be built outside of current industrial facilities and industrial development would not be
located closer to residential areas.  See also Response 7-40.

Response 7-42

The impacts of exposure to toxic air contaminants associated with the proposed project were
evaluated at the various project locations.  Based on the result of the analysis, the exposure to toxic
air contaminants was determined to be less than significant.  Therefore, no significant health
impacts were identified for the proposed project.  The cumulative impacts associated with the
proposed project sites were also determined to be less than significant so that the proposed project
is not expected to result in significant exposure to toxic air contaminants.  See also Response 7-10
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Also, note that the proposed project is expected to result in the production of cleaner fuels,
resulting in reduced emissions from vehicles that use the fuels, and thus generating less emissions
from vehicles.  In addition, the overall proposed project, which includes phasing out MTBE, is
being undertaken to eliminate the source of ground water contamination, which is also an
environmental benefit.

As already noted in Responses 7-40 and 7-41, the proposed project is not expected to contribute to
urban blight in any areas in the vicinity of the proposed project site.

The SEIR has correctly disclosed the potential environmental impacts associated with the proposed
project so that decision-makers can take this information into account when making decisions
regarding the proposed project.

Response 7-43

No significant effects with respect to social or economic impacts have been identified for the
proposed project so that no mitigation measures are required for social issues.  See also Responses
7-40, 7-41, and 7-42.

Response 7-44

The proposed project is not expected to result in a significant increase in noise or a significant
noise impact (see Chapter 4, Section F – Noise).  This conclusion is not only based on project noise
levels being consistent with the general plan or local noise ordinances, it is also based on the
proposed project not exceeding other significant criteria identified in Chapter 4, Section F.

Response 7-45

The noise levels at the Marine Tank Farm and the Marine Terminal have been estimated based on
the land use at each site (65-70 dBA, see page 3-50 of the Final SEIR).  Further the proposed
project is not expected to add equipment that generates significant noise levels.  New pumps will
be added to the Marine Tank Farm and the noise associated with that pump is expected to be at
background levels within 100 feet based on the noise rating of the equipment.  The closest
residential area to the Marine Tank Farm is about one-half mile away.  So noise related to the
Marine Tank Farm would not be noticeable.  The modifications to the Marine Terminal only
include the change of service of a storage tank and the construction of an external floating roof.  No
new operational noise increases are expected at the Marine Terminal so no additional noise would
not be generated at the Marine Terminal.  The closest resident to the Marine Terminal is over one
mile away so no noise increases are expected at residential areas..

Response 7-46

The comment is incorrect and no additional data have been provided to indicated that the analyses
in the SEIR is inadequate.  The analysis of the noise impacts is contained in the Final SEIR (see
Chapter 4, Section F – Noise) and included a noise analysis during both the construction and
operation phases.  The analysis indicates that:  (1)  the noise increase associated with the Refinery
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would be less than one dBA, and less than significant during both construction and operation and
would comply with the City of Los Angeles Noise Ordinance; (2) the modifications to the Marine
Tank Farm would be less than significant and comply with the Los Angeles Noise Ordinance; (3)
the modifications to the Olympic Tank Farm will be less than significant and comply with the City
of Los Angeles Noise Ordinance; and (4) the modifications to the Marine Terminal would be less
than significant and comply with the City of  Los Angeles Noise Ordinance.

Response 7-47

The comment is quoting from the CEQA Guidelines and court cases and does not raise any issues
related to the SEIR so no comment is required.  The SCAQMD has quantitatively and adequately
analyzed all aspects in accordance with CEQA.

Response 7-48

The SCAQMD is aware of its responsibilities under CEQA to adopt feasible mitigation measures
where significant impacts have been identified (CEQA Guidelines §15126.4(a)(1)(A)).  Mitigation
measures are not required for effects which are not found to be significant (CEQA Guidelines
§15126.4(a)(3)).  Mitigation measures must be consistent with all applicable constitutional
requirements including that there must be a connection between the mitigation measure and a
legitimate governmental interest and the mitigation measure must be roughly proportional to the
impacts of the project ((CEQA Guidelines §15126.4(a)(4)(A-B).

Further, “if the lead agency determines that a mitigation measure cannot be legally imposed, the
measure need not be proposed or analyzed.  Instead, the EIR may simply reference that fact and
briefly explain the reasons underlying the lead agency’s determination” ((CEQA Guidelines
§15126.4(a)(5)).

The above requirements have been reviewed and feasible mitigation measures have been imposed
on the proposed project, per these requirements.

Response 7-49

The comment that the CARB Phase 3 regulations include a sulfur limit for diesel engines of 15
ppm is incorrect.  CARB Phase 3 requirements include specifications for the make-up of
reformulated gasoline.  The CARB Phase 3 requirements do not include requirements that low
sulfur diesel be available for use in on-road engines by December 31, 2002. CARB has developed
diesel fuel regulations that limits the sulfur content in diesel fuel to 15 ppm (down from the
previous 500 ppm).  Refiners will be required to start producing the 15 ppm sulfur fuel beginning
June 1, 2006.  For retail stations and wholesale purchasers, highway diesel fuel sold as low sulfur
fuel must meet the 15 ppm sulfur standard by September 1, 2006.

The SEIR already includes a mitigation measure that addresses the use of low sulfur diesel for
construction equipment.  See Mitigation Measure A-9 (Final SEIR page 4-30) which requires the
use of low sulfur diesel, where feasible.  The CEC has imposed essentially the same mitigation
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measure on the construction phase of a number of power plant projects as proposed for the
construction phase of the Ultramar project.

Response 7-50

See Mitigation Measure A-8 (Final SEIR page 4-29) which requires the use of PuriNOx when it is
commercially available and compatible with the engine warranty.

Response 7-51

The use of CARB-certified compressed natural gas – powered construction equipment is not
feasible because construction equipment that uses this fuel is not available.

 The mitigation measure requiring the use of CARB-certified construction equipment has been
imposed on the proposed project (Mitigation Measure A-10, Final SEIR page 4-30).

Response 7-52

SCAQMD is encouraging the use of all air pollution control technologies that have been
demonstrated to be effective and not result in increased emissions (e.g., through increase fuel use or
reduced efficiency of the engine).  The demonstration of the effectiveness of various technologies
is through the U.S. EPA’s or CARB’s certification process.  The agencies have established
programs that require and verify testing data from manufacturers to assure that use of the
technologies will generate air quality benefits.  These controls must be verified by CARB to ensure
that real emission reductions are attained through their use.  Two particulate traps have been
verified by CARB for use on specified on-road engine models.  Due to differences in the engines
between on-road and off-road engines, CARB will need to verify that the particulate traps also are
effective in controlling emissions from off-road engines before they can be considered feasible
mitigation.

Response 7-53

See Response 7-52 regarding the determination of feasible mitigation measures.  The use of low
NOx burners and controls such as SCR and SCONOx are feasible control measures for stationary
emission sources (e.g,. heaters and boilers).  However, the proposed project does not include any
stationary sources of NOx (other than an emergency pump) so that additional NOx control
equipment is not required.

The use of SCR and SCONOx as NOx emission control strategy for heavy-duty diesel applications
is still under research and development and is not commercially available for application on heavy
duty diesel engines at this time.  Further, CARB has not verified emission reductions associated
with SCR on heavy-duty engines.  Until this occurs, the emission reductions associated with the
use of this technology are uncertain and SCR for construction equipment is not considered to be
feasible mitigation under CEQA.  Additionally, the potential hazard impacts associated with such
mitigation would need to be considered.
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Emission offsets are required for new and modified permitted emission sources by SCAQMD
Regulation XIII and/or Regulation XX.  Emission offsets are required for all emission increases
associated with stationary sources, thus minimizing the impacts associated with emissions from
stationary sources.  Per the requirements of SCAQMD Rule 1304(c)(4), offsets are not required for
projects that are needed to comply with state or federal regulations provided that there is no
increase in rating.  The reformulated fuels projects are required to comply with state reformulated
fuels requirements. Therefore, emission offsets are not required for the reformulated fuels projects
identified in this SEIR, as long as there is no increase in the crude capacity of the Refinery.  As
indicated in the SEIR, no increase in the crude capacity at the Refinery is associated with the
proposed project.

Due to state and federal regulations, the SCAQMD has no authority to directly regulate emissions
from marine vessels or locomotive engines. As a result, the SCAQMD has extremely limited
authority to indirectly control emissions from these sources.  See Response 6-3 for further details
regarding the SCAQMD’s authority to regulate mobile sources.

Response 7-54

As indicated in the Final SEIR (page 4-31), the fugitive components will be required to be included
in an inspection and maintenance program, as required by SCAQMD Rule 1173, to ensure that the
equipment is properly maintained. Violations of SCAQMD rules and regulations are subject to
penalties as outlined in SCAQMD Regulation VII.  See also Response 7-18.

Response 7-55

The Refinery currently operates a number of air monitoring devices including continuous emission
monitors on heaters and boilers.  Source testing is also routinely required for refinery combustion
sources.  The predominant source of emissions from the proposed project is from fugitive
components (valves, pumps, flanges, and drains) and indirect emission sources (railcars and trucks)
associated with transportation activities.  VOC emissions from fugitive components are or will be
(for new components) included and monitored as part of the existing inspection and maintenance
program.  The project emissions on toxic air contaminants were less than significant so no
mitigation measures are required for toxic air contaminants.  Other forms of continuous monitoring
on fugitive components are not feasible. During operation, no other stationary source of criteria
pollutants exceed the significance thresholds, so no mitigation measures which would include
monitoring are required.

Response 7-56

CEQA Guidelines §15040(b) states, “CEQA does not grant an agency new powers independent of
the powers granted to the agency by other laws.”  Due to state and federal regulations, the
SCAQMD has no authority to directly regulate emissions from marine vessels or locomotive
engines. As a result, the SCAQMD has extremely limited authority to indirectly control emissions
from these sources.  Neither the SCAQMD nor Ultramar own and control off road marine or
locomotive sources, the SCAQMD cannot require these sources be retrofitted or their engines
replaced.
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The SCAQMD must act within the constraints of the admiralty clause, and the supremacy clause of
the United States Constitution.  Under the supremacy clause, the SCAQMD could be prohibited
from regulating ship emissions, if Congress has explicitly or implicitly foreclosed the regulation of
ship emissions.  As explained in the Mobil Final EIR, the Ports and Waterways Safety Act
("PWSA") preempts the SCAQMD from regulating engine design, construction and operation of
machinery to the extent that such regulation would interfere with vessel safety or protecting the
marine environment.  Similarly, on September 26, 1997, the United States approved Annex VI to
MARPOL 73/78 regarding NOx emissions from marine diesel engines. Under the admiralty clause,
the SCAQMD is prohibited from adopting and enforcing regulations, which interfere with the
proper harmony and uniformity of maritime law.

The Clean Air Act does not preempt "in-use" mitigation measures.  However, in-use measures do
not mitigate air quality impacts or are infeasible since, as previously evaluated in the Mobil Draft
EIR (SCAQMD, 1998) they have a tendency to increase emissions.  The following "in-use"
measures were considered and found to be infeasible or found to be ineffective as mitigation:
limiting the hours of use or the number of engines used; prohibiting railcar visits during first or
second stage smog alerts; imposing fuel specifications; and reducing rail speeds.  It was determined
that imposing these types of mitigation measures would not be expected to be effective in reducing
emissions in the Basin since they would only apply to one company.  Other companies would be
able to transport the materials into the Basin without any such restrictions.  Therefore, no real
emission benefits would be expected.  The Final SEIR has been revised to include more detailed
information on the SCAQMD’s authority to regulate mobile sources (see Final SEIR, Chapter 4,
Section A – Air Quality).

There are some local marine vessels that have been voluntarily repowered. The SCAQMD has
developed a protocol for obtaining NOx credits for repowering or retrofitting marine vessels (Rule
1631 – Pilot Credit Generation Program for Marine Vessels).  Marine retrofit or repowering
projects, however, are all voluntary projects to generate NOx credits applicable to the RECLAIM
program.  Based on exhaustive research conducted by the SCAQMD as part of the Mobil CARB
Phase 2 reformulated gasoline EIR (SCAQMD, 1998), the SCAQMD does not have authority to
directly regulate marine vessel emissions and the SCAQMD cannot require retrofitting, repowering
or controlling emissions from marine vessels unrelated to stationary source equipment.

Based on the above there are no other feasible mitigation measures to minimize or eliminate the
significant emissions from marine vessels associated with the proposed project.

The proposed project is not expected to result in an increase in the marine loading emissions as
materials are not expected to be loaded onto marine vessels.  Rather petroleum products will be
unloaded from marine vessels, which only generates emissions at the storage tanks.  The storage
tanks have been modified to included the installation of internal floating roofs (i.e, BACT), so that
the emissions are controlled to the maximum extent feasible.

Response 7-57

The SEIR included the impact of marine terminal operations on air quality (see Final SEIR,
Chapter 4.0, Section A – Air Quality pages 4-2 through 4-59), water quality (see Final SEIR,



78

Chapter 4.0, Section D – Hydrology/Water Quality, pages 4-75 through 4-83), transportation, (see
Final SEIR, Chapter 4.0, Section H – Transportation/Circulation, pages 4-92 through 4-97), and
hazards (see Final SEIR, Chapter 4.0, Section C- Hazards and Hazardous Materials, pages 4-65
through 4-74 and Volume III).  See also Responses 7-5, 7-24, 7-25, and 7-26 for a discussion of the
analysis of hazard impacts from the proposed  project included in the SEIR.

The proposed project is not expected to result in an increase in hazards associated with the
unloading of materials at the marine terminal because gasoline blending components are currently
transported into the port and through the marine terminal for use at the refinery.  The proposed
project will only result in an increase in the number of ships that visit the port, not a change in
hazards associated with those vessels.  No significant hazard impacts were associated with the
marine terminal activities so there is no need to evaluate alternative locations.  Further, Public
Resources Code §21178(g) exempts projects that will enable the production of CARB Phase 3
compliant fuels from the requirements of analyzing a no project alternative and alternative sites.
The proposed project will allow the production of CARB Phase 3 compliant fuels so that the SEIR
does not need to evaluate alternative locations.  Also, note that the Port of Los Angeles has reduced
the size of virtually all of the petroleum marine terminals within the port and is using the land for
alternate cargo.  Therefore, the feasibility of finding alternative locations for the marine terminal is
considered remote.

Response 7-58

The impacts associated with solid/hazardous waste are addressed in Chapter 4, Section G –
Solid/Hazardous Waste.  As indicated in the Final SEIR, solid waste generated at the Refinery,
Tank Farms and Marine Terminal are generally from administrative offices.  The proposed project
is expected to result in an increase in administrative staff of eight workers at the Tank Farms which
is not expected to substantially increase the amount of solid waste generated by the proposed
project.

The proposed project is not expected to increase the hazardous waste generated by the Refinery
processing, Tank Farm or Marine Terminal activities.  The proposed project is not expected to
change the refining process and only minor changes to refinery units are expected.  The waste
streams generated by the Refinery, Tank Farms, and Marine terminal are not expected to be
affected.  Therefore, the impact of the proposed project on hazardous waste facilities is expected to
be less than significant.

Response 7-59

The project impacts during construction and operation on transportation/traffic were addressed in
the SEIR (see Final EIR, Chapter 4, Section H – Transportation/Traffic, page 4-92, and Appendix
C).  The conclusion of the level of service analysis was that the proposed project would not result
in significant transportation/traffic impacts during either the construction or operational phases so
that mitigation measures are not required.

The proposed project is consistent with the various transportation plans because its impact on
traffic is minimal and less than significant.
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Response 7-60

The impacts associated with the ship traffic were included in the Final SEIR (see page 4-96).  As
stated in the SEIR, the proposed project is expected to increase the number of tanker calls to the
Port by about 65 ships per year. On any one day there will be no increase in marine vessel traffic
within the port because only one ship can dock at the terminal at a time. There will continue to be a
maximum of one ship in the port per day associated with the Ultramar facilities.  Therefore, no
significant adverse impact to the Long Beach/Los Angeles Harbor system is expected.

Response 7-61

CEQA Guidelines §15040(b) states, “CEQA does not grant an agency new powers independent of
the powers granted to the agency by other laws.”  The SCAQMD has no authority to control marine
vessel emissions, i.e., combustion emissions from the engines that propel the vessel.  As a result,
the SCAQMD has no authority to require a mitigation measure to control emissions from these
sources.  Further, since neither the SCAQMD nor Ultramar own and control off road marine
sources, the SCAQMD cannot require these sources be retrofit or their engines replaced.

There are some local marine vessels that have been voluntarily repowered.  As noted in Response
7-56, the SCAQMD has developed a protocol for generating NOx credits from marine vessels
(Rule 1631).  Marine retrofit or repowering projects, however, are all voluntary projects.  Based on
exhaustive research conducted by the SCAQMD as part of the Mobil CARB Phase 2 reformulated
gasoline EIR (SCAQMD, 1998), the SCAQMD does not have authority to directly regulate marine
vessel emissions, i.e., combustion emissions from the engines that propel the vessel.

The SCAQMD is not relying on the Mobil EIR as the CEQA document for the proposed project,
rather the SCAQMD is documenting that a thorough analysis of this issue was conducted therein.
The SEIR cites and summarizes that analysis pursuant to CEQA Guidelines §15148. The Mobil
Final EIR (SCAQMD, 1998) concluded that the SCAQMD must act within the constraints of the
admiralty clause, and the supremacy clause of the United States Constitution.  Under the
supremacy clause, the SCAQMD could be prohibited from regulating ship emissions, if Congress
has explicitly or implicitly foreclosed the regulation of ship emissions. The Ports and Waterways
Safety Act ("PWSA") preempts the SCAQMD from regulating engine design, construction and
operation of machinery to the extent that such regulation would interfere with vessel safety or
protecting the marine environment.  Similarly, on September 26, 1997, the United States approved
Annex VI to MARPOL 73/78 regarding NOx emissions from marine diesel engines.  Under the
admiralty clause, the SCAQMD is prohibited from adopting and enforcing regulations, which
interfere with the proper harmony and uniformity of maritime law.

The Clean Air Act does not preempt "in-use" mitigation measures.  However, in use-measures do
not mitigate air quality impacts or are infeasible since they have a tendency to increase emissions
(see Finale SEIR Chapter 4, Section A – Air Quality).  The following "in-use" measures were
considered and found to be infeasible or found to be ineffective as mitigation:  limiting the hours of
use or the number of engines used; prohibiting visits during first or second stage smog alerts;
imposing fuel specifications; and reducing speeds.  It was determined that imposing these types of
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mitigation measures would not be expected to be effective in reducing emissions in the Basin since
they would only apply to one company.  Other companies would be able to transport the materials
into the Basin without any such restrictions.  Therefore, no real emission benefits would be
expected.

The SCAQMD’s Rule 1142 does not regulate combustion emissions from marine vessel engines
used to propel the vessel.  Rather Rule 1142 regulates the fugitive VOC emissions associated with
the loading of marine vessels.  All marine terminals that transfer petroleum products are subject to
the requirements of SCAQMD Rule 1142, including Ultramar. The proposed project will not result
in an increase in product loaded onto vessels or a related increase in VOC emissions associated
with vessel loading at the marine terminal.

The SCAQMD's District Counsel reviewed similar comments made on this issue on the previous
EIR, reviewed the Draft SEIR before it was released, and reviewed these responses to comments
prior to their release.  The SEIR and the response to comments received on this letter reflects the
opinion of the SCAQMD's District Counsel.

Response 7-62

The comment is incorrect with regard to impacts associated with soil contamination.  Existing laws
and regulations address the discovery and remediation of contaminated sites, including the
discovery of such sites during construction activities. Existing laws require health and safety plans,
working training, and various other activities which serve to protection workers from exposure to
contamination, including 29 CFR Part 1910.120, Hazardous Waste Operations and Emergency
Response (Fed-OSHA, HAZWOPER); CCR 5192, Hazardous Waste Operations and Emergency
Response (Cal-OSHA, HAZWOPER); and SCAQMD Rule 1166, Volatile Organic Compound
(VOC) Emissions from Decontamination of Soil.

All contamination does not need to be remediated, only contamination that exceeds certain
concentrations.  Monitoring required under SCAQMD Rule 1166 can help detect VOC
contamination that exceeds 50 ppmv.  The hazardous waste regulations in Title 22 of the CCR
establish requirements for hazardous waste handling, transport and disposal.  These requirements
apply to all contamination, whether it is discovered as part of construction or some other activities.

The presence of soil contamination will be determined through routine monitoring as required by
SCAQMD Rule 1166.  If contamination is discovered, the health and safety plan will be developed
that specifically requires the use of employees trained in hazardous material/waste procedures,
personnel protective clothing, and so forth that minimize employee exposure.

It should also be noted that, at this time, there is no known soil contamination that will be
encountered within the Refinery, terminals, or along the pipeline route.  As a conservative analysis
for purposes of the SEIR, it was assumed that 10 percent of the soil handled would be contaminated
and properly disposed of or treated onsite.

No significant impacts related to soil contamination were expected, therefore, no mitigation
measures are required for soil contamination.
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Response 7-63

The comment is stating sections of the CEQA statutes and guidelines and does not specifically
criticize or ask questions regarding the Draft SEIR.  The SCAQMD is fully aware of all relevant
CEQA requirements relative to mitigating significant adverse impacts.  The Draft SEIR identified
several environmental resource areas where there was the potential for significant adverse impacts
including air quality and hazards.  In both cases, mitigation measures were imposed or the reasons
that they could not be imposed were evaluated in the SEIR (see Final SEIR pages 4-28 through 4-
56 for air quality mitigation measures and pages 4-73 through 4-74 for hazard mitigation
measures).  Thus, the SEIR has complied with the CEQA requirements for mitigation (CEQA
Guidelines §15126.4).  Also see responses 7-56 and 7-61 regarding the authority to mitigate
emissions from marine vessels and railcars.  The commentator is referred to Response 7-48 through
7-53 regarding discussion of specific types of mitigation measures.

Response 7-64

The comment is stating sections from CEQA court cases and does not specifically criticize or ask
questions regarding the SEIR.  Refer, however, to Response 7-65 regarding the commentator's
opinion that the SEIR for the proposed project defers mitigation.

Response 7-65

Mitigation Measure A-7 recognizes that extensive research on the control of emissions from mobile
sources is currently on-going. The SCAQMD is encouraging the use of all air pollution control
technologies that have been demonstrated to be effective and not result in increased emissions (e.g.,
through increase fuel use or reduced efficiency of the engine).  The demonstration of the
effectiveness of various technologies is through the U.S. EPA’s or CARB’s certification process.
The agencies have established programs that require and verify testing data from manufacturers to
assure that use of the technologies will generate air quality benefits.  These controls must be
verified by CARB to ensure that real emission reductions are attained through their use.  For
example, two particulate traps have been verified by CARB for use on specified on-road engine
models.  Due to differences in the engines between on-road and off-road engines, CARB will need
to verify that the particulate traps also are effective in controlling emissions from off-road engines
before they can be considered feasible mitigation.  Currently, there are few options to control the
emissions from off-road heavy diesel engines and the retrofit technologies are not considered to be
feasible at this time.  Therefore, this mitigation measure has been imposed to require the applicant
to use new technologies that may become available prior to the start of the construction phase of
the proposed project.  The SEIR assumes that the technology will not be available and that the
construction emissions will remain significant (see SEIR Table 4-16).  However, should any
applicable control technologies be certified prior to the beginning of the construction phase, they
will be required to be used.  Mitigation Measure A-7 does not defer mitigation, as suggested in the
comment, but allows for the further control of air emissions, should additional controls become
available in the future.
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Response 7-66

The specific locations of abandoned wells have not been identified.  Sufficient requirements have
been imposed by other agencies (including the Department of Conservation Division of Oil, Gas
and Geothermal Resources) that requires all accessible abandoned wells within 10 feet of
construction activities be tested for oil or gas leakage, and re-abandoned, as required by the
Department of Conservation.  No significant impacts were identified or expected since existing
rules and regulations have been imposed to minimize impacts of the proposed project on
abandoned wells.

Response 7-67

The mitigation measures for the cumulative air quality impacts are discussed in the Final SEIR
pages 5-30 through 5-32. The mitigation measures to minimize emissions associated with
operation of the related projects include the use of BACT for all new emission sources and
modifications to existing sources.  The use of BACT would control localized emissions.  A BACT
review will be completed during the SCAQMD permit approval process for all new/modified
sources.  In addition, the related refinery projects would provide regional emission benefits by
reducing emissions from mobile sources that use the reformulated fuels.

Response 7-68

The comment is incorrect.  The cancer risk at the Ultramar Refinery, Olympic Tank Farm, Marine
Tank Farm and Marine Terminal for both the project scenario and the cumulative operational
scenario is less than significant.  Therefore, no mitigation measures are required (CEQA Guidelines
§15126.4(a)(3)).

Response 7-69

The Final EIR will be revised to reflect the change or potential change in compliance dates for the
phase-out of MTBE.  Also, see Response 3-3.  According to the Governor’s Executive Order, the
compliance date was delayed to assure a reliable gasoline supply in California.  Although Governor
Davis has extended the date one-year for MTBE phase-out, it is still necessary to move forward
with the proposed project as quickly as possible for a number of reasons.  First, the currently
proposed project is in response to unexpected contingencies faced by Ultramar that threatened to
compromise its ability to meet the original phase-out deadline.  Second, given the engineering
complexities of the previously proposed project components of Ultramar’s CARB Phase 3 project,
as well as the currently proposed components, Ultramar must still proceed expeditiously to comply
with the CARB Phase 3 requirements and deadlines.  Third, it is anticipated that the petroleum
industry will move forward with the MTBE phase-out ahead of the revised compliance schedule
currently expected to be adopted by the CARB.  The petroleum industry wants to eliminate MTBE
as expeditiously as possible to remove a potential source of ground water contamination.  Because
Ultramar relies on third party distribution systems, it will be necessary for Ultramar to comply with
the industry imposed phase-out date which may be different from the state required phase-out date.
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Response 7-70

See Response 7-69.  No change in the construction schedule is expected, i.e., construction activities
are expected to occur as soon as all permits have been secured.  Ultramar is continuing to try to
eliminate MTBE by December 31, 2002, but its ability to do so may be impacted by delays in
completing and certifying the CEQA document and receiving permits. Most of the petroleum
industry is trying to eliminate MTBE by December 31, 2002 and some refiners (e.g., BP and
Phillips) have indicated that they will remove MTBE by the original date.  However, some refiners
have not received all necessary permits so that there may be a delay in meeting the December 31,
2002 date.   Governor Davis proposed the extension because of concerns that a sufficient supply of
gasoline (with ethanol) would not be available by December 31, 2002.

Response 7-71

As indicated on page 2-9 of the Final SEIR, “Neither the previously analyzed CARB Phase 3
project at the Ultramar Refinery nor the currently proposed project will increase the Refinery’s
crude throughput capacity.”  See also Response 7-19.

Response 7-72

The proposed project will not increase the processing of distillates at the Ultramar Refinery.  In
order to process additional distillates or make additional distillates, modifications would be
required to various refinery units to increase their capacities.  Currently, only minor modifications
have been proposed to Refinery units to comply with the CARB Phase 3 requirements (e.g.,
modifications so that propane, butane and pentane can be removed to control the vapor pressure of
the gasoline blend).  The proposed project would eliminate the use of MTBE as an oxygenate and
replace it with ethanol.  Currently, MTBE accounts for about 10 percent of the gasoline supply.
Additional gasoline blending components (including alkylate and isooctane) are proposed to be
transported to the marine terminal to partially make up for the loss in gasoline volume associated
with the removal of MTBE.

Response 7-73

The proposed project will not increase the maximum capacity of the refinery to process distillates.

Response 7-74

The text in the Draft SEIR should have read that the proposed project is expected to result in an
increase of 120 trucks per day within the South Coast Air Basin.  However, the Final EIR has been
revised to indicate that, based on more detailed project information, no increase in gasoline
production is expected so no increase in truck traffic associated with gasoline transportation is
expected.
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Response 7-75

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  However, the RMP
referred to on page 2-23 has been prepared for the existing refinery.  As discussed on page 4-74 of
the Final SEIR, the existing RMP will need to be reviewed and revised to include the
propane/propylene storage vessels.  The revisions to the RMP are required within six months of
operation of the new storage vessels.

CEQA does not include any provisions requiring a new RMP or revisions to an existing RMP to be
included in a CEQA document.  However, the hazards analysis included as part of the SEIR
(including Volume III of the SEIR) evaluates the hazards associated with the proposed project.
The RMP contains similar information.  Therefore, the information requested in this comment has
already been provided and circulated to the public.

Response 7-76

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  However, an Emergency
Response Plan, a Fire Prevention Plan and a Process Hazards Safety Review have already been
prepared for the existing facilities, where applicable.  The Emergency Response Plan and Fire
Prevention Plans will be reviewed but no major modifications to these documents are expected to
be required.

CEQA does not include any provisions requiring that a PSM review be included in a CEQA
document. However, as discussed on page 4-74 of the Final SEIR, a PSM is required as part of the
proposed project.  The PSM must be completed prior to operation of the new equipment. The
hazard analysis included as part of the SEIR (including Volume III of the SEIR) evaluates the
hazards associated with the proposed project.  The PSM will include similar information, although
some of the information is more detailed and may contain confidential material.  Public circulation
of the information in a PSM is inappropriate and could lead to safety concerns at the refinery (e.g.,
terrorist concerns).

Response 7-77

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  However, the Title V
permit is currently under review by the SCAQMD.  Based on the SCAQMD’s current schedule, the
Title V permit is expected to be issued during the third quarter of 2002.  Title V permitting is
specifically exempt under CEQA (14 CCR §21080.24) which indicates that CEQA “does not apply
to the issuance, modification, amendment, or renewal of any permit by an air pollution control
district or air quality management district pursuant to Title V.”  Therefore, the Title V permit is not
required to be coordinated with the CARB Phase 3 EIR.

Response 7-78

Based on the health risk assessment for the proposed project and the cumulative project,
Proposition 65 notice is not required because the health risk at all facilities is below the public
notification levels (e.g., less than 10 per million cancer risk).  However, in order to provide full
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public disclosure, Ultramar provides public notification in local newspapers under Proposition 65
on a quarterly basis for all its facilities and will continue to do so.

Response 7-79

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  Transportation permits are
only required to transport overweight, oversized and wide loads on state highways.  The need to
transport such equipment has not been identified and is not expected to be required so that no
permit applications have been submitted or are expected to be required.

Response 7-80

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  Ultramar has submitted
applications to the California Coastal Commission for the CARB Phase 3 project.  It is expected
that a Coastal Development Permit will not be required and that a de minimus waiver will be
issued.  The SEIR has included the environmental review for the Coastal Development permit.  The
decision from the California Coastal Commission is not expected to be finalized until after the
SEIR is certified.

Response 7-81

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  Ultramar has not applied to
the Port of Los Angeles for building permits related to the proposed project.  A building permit will
not be submitted until the SEIR is certified.  Note that the building permit process is not considered
to be a discretionary action or review so it is exempted under CEQA.  Therefore, the timing for this
permit is uncertain at this time.

Response 7-82

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  Ultramar has not applied to
the Port of Los Angeles for a grading permit related to the proposed project because no grading
permit will be required for activities within the Port for the proposed project.

Response 7-83

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  Ultramar has not applied to
the Port of Los Angeles for a franchise permit related to the proposed project because no franchise
permit will be required from the Port of Los Angeles for the proposed project.

Response 7-84

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  Ultramar has not applied to
the Port of Los Angeles for a plumbing or electrical permit related to the proposed project.  No
plumbing or electrical permits are required from the Port of Los Angeles for the proposed project.
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Response 7-85

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  Ultramar already has
submitted a hazardous materials business plan to the Port of Los Angeles.  The business plan is a
reporting requirement and not subject to a discretionary action under CEQA so the SEIR is not
used as the environmental review document for this process.  The hazardous materials business
plan must be updated, if necessary, within 180 days after completion of the proposed project.

Response 7-86

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  Ultramar has not applied to
Cal OSHA for construction related permits for this project.  It is expected that a Cal OSHA permit
will be required for construction of the pipeline. The timing for submittal of this permit will be
after the certification of the SEIR and is expected to be in December 2002.  The Cal OSHA permits
are not subject to a discretionary action under CEQA so the SEIR is not used as the environmental
review document for this process.

Response 7-87

As indicated on pages 3-39 and 3-40 of the Final SEIR, the Refinery has an existing Industrial
Wastewater Discharge Permit for the Refinery and Marine Tank Farm.  As indicated on page 4-53
of the Final SEIR, “the proposed project is not expected to result in an increase in wastewater
discharged from the Refinery, Marine Tank Farm, or Olympic Tank Farm since there are no new
units that would generate additional wastewater discharge.”  Therefore, no modifications or
changes are expected to be required to the LACSD permits.

Response 7-88

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  The Los Angeles
Department of Water and Power owned the Olympic Tank Farm and Marine Tank Farm in 1999,
2000 and 2001.

The Los Angeles Department of Water and Power operated the Olympic Tank Farm and Marine
Tank Farm in 1999, 2000 and through June 2001.

Response 7-89

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  The Los Angeles
Department of Water and Power continues to own the Olympic and Marine Tank Farms.  Ultramar
took over a lease from the Los Angeles Department of Water and Power and began operating the
Olympic and Marine Tank Farms in July 2001.

Response 7-90

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  The lease between
Ultramar and the Port expired in January 2002.  Ultramar is currently negotiating with the Port to
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extend the lease to allow for the smooth transition of closing the terminal and finalizing the
demolition and remediation of the terminal, as necessary.

Response 7-91

Ground water monitoring was conducted as part of property transactions at the Marine and
Olympic Tank Farm, prior to Ultramar taking over a lease from the Los Angeles Department of
Water and Power.  Ground water samples were taken from the site and tested for volatile organic
compounds and heavy metals.  No evidence of ground water contamination was observed at the
Marine or Olympic Tank Farm.

Response 7-92

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  However, Ultramar has not
released the contractor bids for all portions of the proposed project.  Therefore, the cost of the
project is not known.  Further, the cost of the project is irrelevant to the EIR.  Based on costs
estimates from the CARB, capital improvement costs at all refineries in California are estimated to
be about one billion dollars; capital expenditures at pipeline terminals and ethanol off-loading sites
for the handling, storage and blending of ethanol is about $60 million; and additional increased
costs, beyond those currently experienced for MTBE, are expected to import ethanol, gasoline, and
gasoline blend stocks.

Response 7-93

As indicated on page 4-17 of the Final SEIR, “Proposed projects that are consistent with the local
General Plans are consistent with the air quality related regional plans. The proposed project is
considered to be consistent with the air quality related regional plans since it is consistent with the
City of Los Angeles’ General Plan.”  See Response 7-95 for additional information regarding why
the proposed project is consistent with the AQMP.  The proposed project is to produce gasoline in
compliance with CARB Phase 3 requirements.  These requirements have been included as part of
the State Implementation Plan (SIP); therefore, the proposed project is consistent with the SIP.

Response 7-94

As indicated in Chapter 4 – Section E, Land Use/Planning, the proposed project is consistent with
the Los Angeles General Plan (including the Wilmington-Harbor City Community Plan).  The
Refinery, marine terminal and storage tank farms are all within existing industrial zoned areas.
Heavy industrial land uses would be the only land uses compatible with the surrounding areas.  The
proposed project is consistent with the Los Angeles General Plan.  See also Response 7-9.

Response 7-95

As indicated on page 4-17 of the Final EIR, “The proposed project is considered to be consistent
with the air quality related regional plans (including the AQMP).  The 1991 AQMP specifically
included control measure ARB-6-New Gasoline Specifications, Phase 2 Reformulated Gasoline.
CARB adopted regulations implementing control measure ARB-6 in 1991, which became effective
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in 1996.  Projects undertaken to comply with AQMP control measures are considered to be
consistent with AQMP.

In December, 1999, CARB adopted new gasoline specifications, CARB Phase 3, prohibiting the
use of MTBE as an oxygenate, while establishing more stringent standards for sulfur and benzene
content in gasoline.  CARB Phase 3 contributes to further emission reductions from gasoline
combustion in on-road vehicles beyond those obtained from control measure ARB-6.  Because
CARB Phase 3 reformulated gasoline projects contribute to further emission reductions from on-
road sources beyond those obtained from 1991 AQMP control measure ARB-6, they are considered
consistent with the AQMP.

Response 7-96

As noted in Response 7-58, Public Resources Code §21178(g) exempts projects that enable the
production of CARB Phase 3 compliant fuels.  In spite of this exemption, Chapter 6 - Project
Alternatives in the Draft and Final SEIR discussed potential alternative locations for the storage of
petroleum products.  All alternatives would result in significant impacts to air quality and hazards.
As indicated in the Final SEIR, no feasible alternatives were identified that would reduce the air
quality or hazard impacts to less than significant.

Further, the California Energy Commission (CEC) prepared a report which states that tank storage
for clean products and product blending, which is currently already severely constrained in the Los
Angeles Basin, will be reduced by 10 to 15% over the next seven years due to the need to comply
with new air quality regulations to obtain emission reductions.  The phase-out of MTBE has
created the need to keep more different product in segregated storage, which ultimately limits the
effectiveness of tank usage and contributes to infrastructure restrictions.  The issue is further
complicated by the need to provide a separate tank for each product throughout the distribution
system.  Some MTBE tanks will be useful for the alternative materials, but the tankage system does
not have the capacity or the additional number of spare tanks to meet the requirements of so many
new streams.  Especially in the Los Angeles Basin, tank space for all products from crude oil to
clean, is currently extremely difficult to find, and refiners are forced to lease tank space (California
Energy Commission, MTBE Phase Out in California, March 2002, P600-002-008CR).  As a result,
alternative tank farm sites are, generally, unavailable.

Response 7-97

See Responses 7-58 and 7-96 regarding alternative locations for storage of petroleum products.
The proposed project will modernize existing tank farms, which will result in safer, less polluting
storage tanks at the proposed project site.  No storage tanks will be located outside of the existing
storage tank farm boundaries.  The proposed project will not place storage tanks any closer to
residential areas than currently exist.  (Note:  even without the proposed project storage tanks will
continue to be located at the Olympic and Marine Tank Farms.)  The modifications to the tank
farms include replacing old tanks, building new tanks, installing Best Available Control
Technology on tanks that include internal floating roof tanks, and installing leak detection systems.
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Response 7-98

See Responses 7-58, 7-96 and 7-97 regarding alternative locations for storage tanks.

Response 7-99

The project at the Marine Terminal is part of the Port’s overall redevelopment plan which includes
remediation and clean up of contamination found at the site.  According to the Port, it is likely that
the Regional Water Quality Control Board would be the agency responsible for site remediation
due to its jurisdictional authority over projects with potential groundwater contamination.  Except
for enforcement of Rule 1166 – Volatile Organic Compound Emissions from Decontamination of
Soil, the SCAQMD has no approval authority over site remediation projects.  Further, because it
has primary approval authority over projects at the Marine Terminal, the Port, which is the
appropriate lead agency under CEQA, has indicated that it is in the process of preparing an EIR for
the revdevelopment plan, which will include site remediation impacts as well as reuse of the
Ultramar site and adjacent terminals as a general cargo terminal.  With regard to the CEQA
document, the Port is currently preparing the initial study for the project.

Response 7-100

This comment is not related to the environmental analysis in the SEIR.  The timeline for the
dismantling and remediation of the Ultramar’s Marine Terminal has not yet been established.  The
timing for the closure of the Marine Terminal is currently being negotiated with the Port of Los
Angeles and is not yet finalized.

Response 7-101

The comment regarding piecemealing is incorrect.  There are two clear and distinct projects that are
unrelated, i.e., one does not rely on the other:  (1) compliance with the CARB Phase 3 requirements
for which the SCAQMD is the lead agency and which involves a number of facilities; and (2)
dismantling, remediation and redevelopment of the Marine Terminal for which the Port of Los
Angeles is the lead agency.  The CARB Phase 3 project has statutory requirements for compliance.
Negotiations are currently going on between the Port of Los Angeles  and Ultramar regarding the
dismantling and remediation of the Marine Terminal.

The project at the Marine Terminal is part of the Port’s overall redevelopment plan which includes
remediation and clean up of contamination found at the site.  According to the Port, it is likely that
the Regional Water Quality Control Board would be the agency responsible for site remediation
due to its jurisdictional authority over projects with potential groundwater contamination.  Except
for enforcement of Rule 1166 – Volatile Organic Compound Emissions from Decontamination of
Soil, the SCAQMD has no approval authority over site remediation projects.  Further, because it
has primary approval authority over projects at the Marine Terminal, the Port, which is the
appropriate lead agency under CEQA, has indicated that it is in the process of preparing an EIR for
the revdevelopment plan, which will include site remediation impacts as well as reuse of the
Ultramar site and adjacent terminals as a general cargo terminal.  With regard to the CEQA
document, the Port is currently preparing the initial study for the project. Ultramar could not wait
until all issues were worked out with the Port before going forward with the CARB Phase 3 project



90

because of the state mandated requirements to phase-out MTBE in gasoline no later than December
31, 2003.  Therefore, the Port may need to consider the CARB Phase 3 project as a cumulative
project, when and if a CEQA document is prepared for the dismantling, remediation and reuse of
the Ultramar Marine Terminal.

Response 7-102

The SCAQMD CEQA Air Quality Handbook (SCAQMD 1993) defines the environmental baseline
as the emissions that have occurred over the previous two years.  The use of the last two years of
emissions data as the environmental baseline is consistent with SCAQMD policy.

Response 7-103

The proposed project is required to comply with the Department of Conservation Division of Oil,
Gas and Geothermal Resources requirements with respect to plugging and abandoned wells, as
indicated on page 4-60 of the Final SEIR.  Therefore, the proposed project is expected to be
consistent with the Division of Oil and Gas requirements.

Response 7-104

The comment regarding CEQA §21002.1(c) is incorrect and has been misquoted. CEQA
§21002.1(c) indicates the following:

“If economic, social, or other conditions make it infeasible to mitigate one or more
significant effects on the environment of a project, the project may nonetheless be carried
out or approved at the discretion of a public agency if the project is otherwise permissible
under applicable laws and regulations.”

The proposed project is needed to comply with state mandated CARB Phase 3 reformulated
gasoline requirements.  As addressed in the various responses to comments, the proposed project is
expected to comply with applicable rules and regulations.  Further, the commentator has not cited
any specific laws or regulations with which the proposed project is, in fact, not in compliance.

Response 7-105

The EIR has addressed the impacts associated with the potential exposure to all populations
(regardless of race or economic status) near the Refinery, Marine Terminal and tank farms
including sensitive populations, residents and workers.  The proposed project is not expected to
result in a significant increase or change in the population of the areas surrounding the Refinery,
and the impact on population is considered less than significant (see the NOP for a further
discussion).  The comment references state policies on environmental justice.  While those policies
do not control CEQA review, it is instructive to note that in a 1998 decision, U.S. EPA’s Office of
Civil Right’s held that if a facility does not cause an adverse impact, it cannot be found to have a
disproportionate impact on disadvantaged communities or communities of color (Select Steel,
1998).  There are no requirements to analyze environmental justice as a separate issue in the CEQA
process, as explained in the responses to the NOP.
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The comment compares the project with proposals for placing new facilities in disadvantaged
communities.  This is not a valid comparison because the facilities associated with the proposed
project are existing facilities that have maintained operations over a long period during which the
character of the community around it has changed.  The proposed project is to modify an existing
Refinery and terminals that have been located at their current sites for over 30 years and not the
siting of new refineries or terminals.  Therefore, there has been no discrimination in the selection of
the project locations.  Additionally, the Wilmington area has not been singled out for this project as
reformulated fuels projects have been undertaken wherever existing refineries and terminals are
located (including, the cities of Carson, Long Beach, Signal Hill, South Gate, Vernon, Orange,
Colton, Rialto, Van Nuys, El Segundo, Los Angeles, and Torrance).

The impacts of the proposed project on toxic air contaminants were analyzed and concluded to be
less than significant (see Chapter 4, Section A – Air Quality, pages 4-19 through 4-28 and Volume
II).  Further, as discussed on page 5-20 of the Final SEIR, the CARB Phase 3 compliant fuels are
expected to result in a 7.2 percent reduction in potency-weighted emissions of toxic air
contaminants from mobile sources using the fuel providing additional emissions benefits.
Therefore, the proposed project is expected to reduce cancer risk from mobile sources that use the
CARB Phase 3 fuel.

The proposed project will allow Ultramar to comply with CARB’s Phase 3 Reformulated Fuels
requirement.  These requirements will reduce motor vehicle emissions of hydrocarbons by about
one-half ton per day, NOx by about 19 tons per day, and toxics by 7.2%.  While exact impacts have
not been calculated, it is expected that a roughly proportional reduction in motor vehicle emissions
will occur in the Wilmington area.  Since significant reductions in mobile source emissions are
essential to attain ozone and PM10 standards, this project will contribute to air quality benefits in
Wilmington and throughout the region.

The commenter asserts that the EIR must discuss how communities of color, such as Latino
communities living near the Refinery, are disproportionately impacted by environmental hazards.
CEQA does not contain a requirement for a discussion of impacts on specific groups.  However,
that does not mean the SCAQMD is failing to address environmental justice issues.  CEQA does
contain a requirement to adopt all feasible mitigation measures to reduce any significant impact on
the environment, including air quality and human health, regardless of who is impacted.  The
SCAQMD will require all feasible mitigation measures.  Also, under CEQA the SCAQMD may
not approve any project with significant adverse impacts unless it makes a finding that specific
overriding considerations justify approval of the project.  These requirements parallel the
requirements under Title VI of the Civil Rights Act to address environmental justice concerns.

In addition, the SCAQMD has demonstrated its commitment to environmental justice by adopting a
comprehensive program of measures to reduce adverse environmental justice impacts.  The original
10 environmental justice initiatives, adopted in 1997, have been completed or are ongoing.  These
include: Town Hall Meetings, ambient monitoring of air toxics, community response teams,
expanded CEQA commenting, an Environmental Justice Task Force, participating in a City of Los
Angeles Environmental Justice Forum, providing incentives for early clean-up or removal of diesel
engines, improved field inspection technology, portable equipment guidelines to protect sensitive
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receptors, and amending air toxic control rules, Rules 1402 and 1402, to further reduce toxic
emissions.

Beyond these original 10 initiatives, the SCAQMD has adopted a number of additional measures
which reduce emissions in areas impacted by air toxics.  An outgrowth of the SCAQMD’s Multiple
Air Toxics Exposure Study (MATES-II) conducted in 1998-1999 was a landmark series of fleet
rules requiring alternative fuel vehicles to replace diesel vehicles in many public fleets, including
transit and school buses.  Also, the SCAQMD adopted a rule to significantly reduce the sulfur
content of diesel fuel.

Similarly, in March 2000, the SCAQMD adopted an Air Toxics Control Plan designed to achieve
an additional 50% reduction from today’s levels in air toxics exposure, including measures for
source-specific rules.  The SCAQMD has also adopted measures to specifically reduce risks in the
port areas.  These include Rule 1158 amendments to prohibit open storage of petroleum coke, and a
large number of incentive grants to reduce diesel emissions from marine vessels in the ports.  Some
incentive programs, including the Carl Moyer program for diesel clean-up, are required to target
funds to areas having the highest exposure to pollutant concentrations, including low income
populations and communities of color, or both.  The SCAQMD has voluntarily incorporated this
concept into other incentive programs.  The SCAQMD has also adopted a program of extensive
targeted outreach toward ethnic communities in the basin, designed to insure these communities are
adequately informed and know how to make their voices heard.

This July, SCAQMD staff has proposed a series of further enhancements to the SCAQMD’s
environmental justice programs.  Some of these measures are specifically targeted to benefit the
areas affected by this project (see Response 44-2 for more details on the environmental justice
initiatives). In particular, staff proposes development of a low-emission and clean-equipment
control measure for the category of off-road intermodal equipment, such as that operated at ports
and large distribution centers, including off-road diesel equipment.  This measure will further
reduce diesel emissions in the port.  Similarly, the SCAQMD staff has proposed adoption of a rule
to require the use of modified HF or alternative processes that eliminate the use of concentrated
HF.  Ultramar is the only Refinery still using concentrated HF and will be directly required by this
rule to reduce the risk posed to the community of accidental toxic exposure.

Thus, the SCAQMD is actively pursuing a myriad of measures to reduce risks, some of which are
specifically targeted at the areas affected by the Ultramar project, and is fully committed to
implementing concrete measures to address environmental justice concerns.  In discussing how to
reduce disparate impacts, U.S. EPA has stated, “Efforts that focus on all contributions to the
disparate impact, not just the permit at issue, will likely yield the most effective long-term
solutions.”  (65 Fed.Reg. at 29662, June 27, 2000.)  The SCAQMD is carrying out an aggressive
program of controls for all sources within the SCAQMD’s jurisdiction that contribute to air quality
concerns in the affected area as well as a comprehensive program of environmental justice
measures, consistent with U.S. EPA’s recommendation.
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Response 7-106

Public notice of the proposed project was provided per the requirements of the California
Environmental Quality Act (CEQA).  The Public Resources Code (PRC) §21092 requires that
notice “shall be given to the last known name and address of all organizations and individuals who
have previously requested notice and shall also be given by at least one of the following
procedures:”  (A) Publication in a newspaper of general circulation in the area affected by the
proposed project.  “If more than one area will be affected, the notice shall be published in the
newspaper of largest circulation from among the newspapers of general circulation in those areas.”
(B) posting of the notice on- and off-site in the area where the project is to be located; and (C)
direct mailing to the owners and occupants of contiguous property shown on the latest equalized
assessment roll.

Public notice of the availability of the Draft SEIR was provided in several different ways.  First,
notice was given via direct mailing to the last known name and address of all organizations and
individuals who have previously requested notice, including all individuals and agencies that
previously provided comments on the previous Notice of Preparation and the previous Draft EIR
(§21092(b)(3)). Second, notice was provided in the Los Angeles Times, the newspaper of largest
circulation on March 8, 2002.  These actions comply with the minimum CEQA requirements.  In
addition to these minimum requirements, additional noticing was provided as follows.  Per PRC
§21092(b)(3)(B), the notice was posted off-site at the Los Angeles County Clerk’s Office (see also
CEQA Guidelines §15187(d)).  The notice was provided via electronic mail to a number of
interested entities including environmental groups, public agencies and interested individuals that
have expressed interest in receiving SCAQMD environmental notices.  Finally, the document itself
was available online at the SCAQMD’s website the first day of the public comment period and also
hardcopies of the document were available the first day of the public comment period at the
SCAQMD’s headquarters located at 21865 E. Copley Drive, Diamond Bar, California.

Based on the above, public notice has been provided on the proposed project in a manner that
meets and exceeds the CEQA requirements for public notice on the availability of SEIR.  CEQA
does not require that the documents be translated into Spanish.  Note that several comment letters
were received in Spanish during the public comment period.  Responses to the Spanish comment
letters were prepared in both Spanish and English (see Response to Comment letter No. 8).

With regard to the June 20, 2002 public meeting on the CEQA document, for the proposed project
held in the Wilmington Community, notices about the meeting were distributed in Spanish and
English.  Further, the SCAQMD arranged for a Spanish translator to be present at the public
meeting.
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At its July 12, 2002 meeting, the SCAQMD Governing Board released its Proposed Enhancements
to the SCAQMD’s Environmental Justice Program for review and comment by the public.
Enhancement II-15 describes the SCAQMD’s commitment to increase the involvement of minority
communities in SCAQMD town hall or other meetings by making “further efforts to translate
pertinent public notices into multiple languages, as applicable, to the cultural and ethnic
populations of individual neighborhoods and communities.”  At this time, Enhancement II-15 does
not apply to complex technical documents, such as CEQA documents.

Response 7-107

See Response 7-106 with respect to public notice.

CEQA does not require that a public hearing be held as part of the CEQA process for a proposed
project.  CEQA Guidelines §15202 states in part “CEQA does not require formal hearings at any
stage of the environmental review process.  Public comments may be restricted to written
communication” (CEQA Guidelines §15202).  At a meeting with Mr. Marquez on April 23, 2002 at
the SCAQMD headquarters, the SCAQMD’s Executive Officer agreed to hold a public meeting on
the proposed project in the Wilmington community on June 20, 2002.  The meeting focused on the
Draft SEIR for the proposed project and SCAQMD responses to comments on the Draft SEIR.
Further, a town hall meeting was held in Wilmington on July 31, 2002 to obtain additional input
from the Wilmington community on air quality issues, including Ultramar’s proposed project, and
the proposed environmental justice enhancements.

Response 7-108

The SCAQMD strongly disagrees with the commentator's opinion that the Draft SEIR is
inadequate and should be re-done and re-circulated. Based on comments received on the Draft
SEIR, minor revisions have been made in the Final SEIR.  As discussed in all of the previous
Responses (Responses 7-1 through 7-107), those revisions did not constitute significant new
information, result in impacts greater than those that were evaluated in the Draft SEIR, or
constitute significant new information that would trigger recirculation of the Draft SEIR pursuant
to CEQA Guidelines §15088.5.  Therefore, the Draft SEIR does not need to be revised and re-
circulated for public review.

Response 7-109

CBE is already on the SCAQMD's list of interested persons for this project and all other CEQA
projects and has received all related notices associated with this project.

Response 7-110

In compliance with the CEQA Guidelines (§15088(a)), the SCAQMD as the lead agency will
evaluate all comments on environmental issues received from persons who reviewed the Draft
SEIR and will prepare written responses. Responses will be provided to the commentator.




